Opening Date:July 16, 2009

BID#5060-NS SEB Machine Tools

BUYER: Nereida Strucely

C&D Industrial Tools &

I:\T(T Description Qty Kiesub Electroniéitizgglg Satco Supply Campbell TtI)Ec;(Itse Ec?éd Supplies, Inc —
Unit Price . Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price . Unit Price .
Price Price Price
5/8" t-slot holdowns for mills. Rutland Tools P/N
1 |2354 9990 or equal 5 $129.41 $647.05 $85.76 $428.80 $86.60 $433.00 $97.00 $485.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2354 9990 TE-co #12625CKUS | As Specd | As Specd
4" bench top machinists vise. Rutland Tools P/N
2 |2294 1156 or equal 3 $740.00 $2,220.00 $401.29 $1,203.87 $484.00 $1,452.00 | $601.15 | $1,803.45
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2299 1156 Wilton #400S(10016) | As Specd | As Specd
20" floor drill press. Rutland Tools P/N 2666
3 [2204 or equal 1| $1,430.41 $1,430.41 $913.00 $913.00 $1,260.00 | $1,260.00 | $1,161.85| $1,161.85
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2666 2204 Wilton #2550 As Specd | As Specd
darex drill sharpener XT3000. Rutland Tools P/N
4 |2546 3000 or equal 1| $4,214.00 $4,214.00 $3,648.00 $3,648.00 $3,709.00 | $3,709.00 | $3,422.80 | $3,422.80
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2546 3000 Darex #XT3000 As Specd [ As Specd
6" carbide tool grinder. Rutland Tools P/N 2678
5 |5000 or equal 1| $1,443.48 $1,443.48 | $1,093.00 $1,093.00 $1,265.00 | $1,265.00 | $1,086.10 | $1,086.10
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2678 5000 Baldor #510 As Specd | As Specd
120 gt. Carbide grinding wheel. Rutland Tools
6 |P/N 2678 3121 or equal 1 $107.80 $107.80 $81.68 $81.68 $121.00 $121.00 $81.10 $81.10
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2678 3121 Baldor Ci121 Carborundum | #5539509564
200 gt. diamond wheel. Rutland Tools P/N 2089
7 2120 or equal 1 $235.00 $235.00 $489.92 $489.92 $207.00 $207.00 $170.75 $170.75
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2089 2120 | Alt;Baldor #0502 220 grit | As Specd | As Specd
6" bench grinder. Rutland Tools P/N 2678 6120
8 |or equal 1 $327.00 $327.00 $256.72 $256.72 $288.00 $288.00 $251.40 $251.40
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2678 6120 Baldor #612R As Specd [ As Specd
disc and belt sander combo 6x48 12. Rutland
9 |Tools P/N 2684 1210 or equal 1| $2,582.35 $2,582.35 [ $2,168.00 $2,168.00 $2,262.00 | $2,262.00 | $2,085.25 | $2,085.25
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2684 1210 | Kalumagoo S612V.1 As Specd | As Specd
10 ton press. Rutland Tools P/N 2647 9200 or
10 |equal 1| $3,395.00 $3,395.00 $2,589.00 $2,589.00 $2,835.00 | $2,835.00 | $2,612.50 | $2,612.50
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2647 9200 Dake #09205 As Specd [ As Specd
dake vert band saw V-24. Rutland Tools P/N
11 [2647 9123 or equal 1| $14,060.00 [ $14,060.00 | $12,839.00 $12,839.00 $12,320.00 [ $12,320.00 {$11,711.00{ $11,711.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2645 9123 Dake V-24 As Specd | As Specd
arbor press 1 1/2 ton. Rutland Tools P/N 2674
12 |1005 or equal 1 $464.70 $464.70 $388.96 $388.96 $407.00 $407.00 $375.25 $375.25
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2674 1005 Dake #01005 As Specd [ As Specd
8.8" kurt vise with swivel base. Rutland Tools
13 [P/N 5000 2130 or equal 4 $917.00 $3,668.00 $862.45 $3,449.80 $920.00 $3,680.00 | $744.50 | $2,978.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #5000 2130 Kurt D688S As Specd | As Specd
6" vise with hardjaw kit. Rutland Tools P/N 2293
14 16252 or equal 1| $2,192.00 $2,192.00 $1,812.00 $1,812.00 $1,898.00 | $1,898.00 | $1,749.20 | $1,749.20
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2293 6252 Kurt HDLM6J As Specd [ As Specd
2.5" aluminum jaw kit. Rutland Tools P/N 2293
15 [6274 or equal 1 $315.48 $315.48 $312.69 $312.69 $246.00 $246.00 $265.00 $265.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2293 6274 Kurt HD6A2.5 As Specd | As Specd
5c collet holder angled. Rutland Tools P/N 2293
16 |5130 or equal 1| $1,470.24 $1,470.24 $1,069.00 $1,069.00 $1,273.00 | $1,273.00 | $1,173.25| $1,173.25
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2293 5130 Kurt K5CVMAB As Specd [ As Specd
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1/4" parallel set. Rutland Tools P/N 2293 5992 or

17 [equal 4 $156.47 $625.88 $119.66 $478.64 $133.00 $532.00 $126.35 $505.40
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2293 5992 Kurt #8PS9 As Specd | As Specd
toolmakers vise. Rutland Tools P/N 2304 3000 or

18 |equal 2 $167.00 $334.00 $112.57 $225.14 $144.00 $288.00 $133.00 $266.00

Brown +

Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2304 3000 Sharpe #599-752-3 As Specd | As Specd
thin parallel set. Rutland Tools P/N 2159 0210 or

19 |equal 1 $186.90 $186.90 $118.25 $118.25 $162.00 $162.00 $149.15 $149.15

Brown +

Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2159 0210 Sharpe #599-921-20 As Specd | As Specd
12" rotary table. Rutland Tools P/N 2446 2412 or

20 [equal 1| $3,392.44 $3,392.44 $0.00 $3,299.00 | $3,299.00 | $2,659.70 | $2,659.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2446 2412 No Bid No Bid As Specd [ As Specd
wheel arbor buffing wheels. Rutland Tools P/N

21 |2063 7406 or equal 6 $0.44 $2.64 $0.53 $3.18 $0.30 $1.80 $0.33 $1.98
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2063 7406 Dico #535-58 As Specd | As Specd
r8 collet and tool tray. Rutland Tools P/N 2495

22 [3208 or equal 1 $28.75 $28.75 $15.00 $15.00 $19.58 $19.58 $20.55 $20.55
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2495 3208 MEDA #1995000 Quality Natl #239-9815
pedestal for grinder. Rutland Tools P/N 2678

23 |7114 or equal 1 $267.11 $267.11 $213.96 $213.96 $301.00 $301.00 $199.80 $199.80
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2678 7114 Baldor GAl4 As Specd | As Specd
indicator sweep for mill. Rutland Tools P/N 2186

24 |8466 or equal 2 $129.00 $258.00 $92.18 $184.36 $96.47 $192.94 $102.95 $205.90
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2186 8466 SPI #20-758-9 SPI #20-758-9
precision vise. Rutland Tools P/N 2304 5004 or

25 |equal 2 $135.45 $270.90 $51.25 $102.50 $128.00 $256.00 $97.90 $195.80
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2304-5004 National NV327 Natl Import #ETV-30a
hex and square 5c collet holder. Rutland Tools

26 [P/N 2401 5389 or equal 2 $72.00 $144.00 $30.70 $61.40 $67.00 $134.00 $53.25 $106.50
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2401 5389 | Production ST5C National #235-7050
indexing head. Rutland Tools P/N 2447 0001 or

27 |equal 1| $1,123.00 $1,123.00 $0.00 $1,067.00 | $1,067.00 $828.75 $828.75
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2447 0001 No Bid No Bid Vertex #CS-8
tail stock for indexing head. Rutland Tools P/N

28 [2446 8120 or equal 1 $241.56 $241.56 $0.00 $86.00 $86.00 $162.35 $162.35
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2446 8120 No Bid No Bid Elephant #ETS-2
2'x3' granite table stand. Rutland Tools P/N 2258

29 2007 or equal 1 $926.09 $926.09 $749.30 $749.30 $773.00 $773.00 $764.80 $764.80
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2258 2007 | Alt: Starrott #82229 As Specd | As Specd
2'x3' cover for granite. Rutland Tools P/N 2258

30 [3006 or equal 1 $80.41 $80.41 $70.75 $70.75 $70.00 $70.00 $67.00 $67.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2258 3006 Starrott #83025 As Specd [ As Specd
5c¢ index head and collets. Rutland Tools P/N

31 |5000 2117 or equal 1 $247.46 $247.46 $0.00 $179.00 $179.00 $168.30 $168.30
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #5000 2117 No Bid No Bid National #SJ-5C
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precision sine vise. Rutland Tools P/N 2166 0420

32 |or equal 1| $1,869.05 $1,869.05 $667.00 $667.00 $720.00 $720.00 $693.50 $693.50
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2166 0420 | Suburban SV337S1 As Specd | As Specd
bore scope. Rutland Tools P/N 2240 0192 or

33 [equal 1 $470.58 $470.58 $0.00 $433.00 $433.00 $380.00 $380.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2240 0192 No Bid No Bid VOScope [ #vo3sioww
minature precision clamp. Rutland Tools P/N

34 |2166 1875 or equal 2 $292.67 $585.34 $0.00 $256.00 $512.00 $218.95 $437.90
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2166 1875 No Bid No Bid As Specd | As Specd
2'x3'x6" granite table. Rutland Tools P/N 2258

35 [0661 or equal 1| $1,154.00 $1,154.00 $1,097.00 $1,097.00 $914.00 $914.00 $904.05 $904.05
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2258 0661 Starrott #80661 As Specd [ As Specd
18"x24" granite table. Rutland Tools P/N 2258

36 |0634 or equal 1 $530.53 $530.53 $455.00 $455.00 $415.00 $415.00 $410.75 $410.75
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2258 0634 Starrott #80634 As Specd | As Specd
12"x8" granite plate. Rutland Tools P/N 2258

37 (1802 or equal 1 $171.29 $171.29 $141.90 $141.90 $144.00 $144.00 $142.70 $142.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2258 1802 Starrott #81802 As Specd [ As Specd
v block set with clamps. Rutland Tools P/N 2255

38 |1312 or equal 2 $231.76 $463.52 $194.35 $388.70 $222.00 $444.00 $187.15 $374.30
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2255 1322 Starrott #278 As Specd | As Specd
HB 400 optical comparator. Rutland Tools P/N

39 [2253 4688 or equal 1| $19,265.00 | $19,265.00 $0.00 $13,097.00| $13,097.00 [$14,900.00{ $14,900.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | 2253 4688 No Bid No Bid As Specd [ As Specd
gailileo ez300 measurment system. Rutland

40 |Tools P/N 2253 3060 or equal 1| $24,746.84 | $24,746.84 $0.00 $20,103.00 [ $20,103.00 [$19,159.00( $19,159.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2253 3060 No Bid No Bid As Specd | As Specd
galileo kinemic inSpecdtion system. Rutland

41 |Tools P/N 2253 3054 or equal 1| $9,895.00 $9,895.00 $0.00 $8,058.00 | $8,058.00 | $7,660.70 | $7,660.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2253 3054 No Bid No Bid As Specd [ As Specd
bandsaw blade 100'. Rutland Tools P/N 2016

42 |0111 or equal 2 $106.27 $212.54 $73.75 $147.50 $116.00 $232.00 $85.85 $171.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2016 0111 Starrott #13837 As Specd | As Specd
workbench for comparator 60"x34". Rutland

43 |Tools P/N 2283 2551 or equal 1 $701.65 $701.65 $549.00 $549.00 $802.00 $802.00 $566.60 $566.60
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2283 2551 Lyon #2551A As Specd [ As Specd
13"x18" bandsaw. Rutland Tools P/N 2673 3110

44 |or equal 1| $8,450.62 $8,450.62 | $6,349.00 $6,349.00 $7,056.00 | $7,056.00 | $6,750.00 | $6,750.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2673 3110 | Wellsaw #1318 As Specd | As Specd
saw blades. Rutland Tools P/N 1985 7196 or

45 |equal 3 $75.64 $226.92 $51.85 $155.55 $62.00 $186.00 $61.10 $183.30

Starrott

Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #1985 7190 | Powerbaud | #99297-12' 6" [ snapOnMilford| #820211812060

46 |8" buffer. Rutland Tools P/N 2529 1866 or equal 1 $223.80 $223.80 $167.97 $167.97 $194.00 $194.00 $169.20 $169.20
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2529 1866 | Palwgren #82083 As Specd [ As Specd
stand for buffer. Rutland Tools P/N 2529 1852 or

47 |equal 1 $140.48 $140.48 $127.60 $127.60 $122.00 $122.00 $106.20 $106.20
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2529 1852 | Palwgren #70101 C.T. As Specd | As Specd
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36"x24" sandblaster. Rutland Tools P/N 2598

48 |2102 or equal 1| $1,057.00 $1,057.00 $948.75 $948.75 $938.00 $938.00 $793.25 $793.25
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2598 2102 | Cyclone #3624 As Specd | As Specd
54"x23"x37"machinist workbench. Rutland Tools

49 |P/N 2279 5414 or equal 3 $283.30 $849.90 $253.67 $761.01 $185.00 $555.00 $209.95 $629.85
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2279 5414 | Waterloo #WB5503 As Specd [ As Specd
60"x24"x37"machinist workbench Rutland Tools

50 |P/N 2279 5418 or equal 1 $669.25 $669.25 $536.75 $536.75 $517.00 $517.00 $502.65 $502.65
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2279 5418 | Waterloo #WB5507 As Specd | As Specd
3/8" tool bits. Rutland Tools P/N 2037 5160 or

51 [equal 4 $37.06 $148.24 $0.00 $33.00 $132.00 $28.35 $113.40
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2032 5160 No Bid No Bid Morse #28104
1/2" tool bits. Rutland Tools P/N 2037 5164 or

52 |equal 4 $60.92 $243.68 $0.00 $69.00 $276.00 $46.60 $186.40
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2037 5164 No Bid No Bid Morse #28106
7 pc multi purpose turning tools. Rutland Tools

53 [P/N 2509 6504 or equal 1 $278.24 $278.24 $239.87 $239.87 $244.00 $244.00 $224.70 $224.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2509 6504 | M100-DEX | #GE45-407103 | As Specd | As Specd
12 pc. r8 collet set. Rutland Tools P/N 2490 3612

54 |or equal 1 $336.00 $336.00 $239.40 $239.40 $294.00 $294.00 $256.50 $256.50
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2490 3612 Lyndex #810-012 As Specd | As Specd
31 pc. 5c¢ collet set. Rutland Tools P/N 2395

55 [6131 or equal 1 $932.14 $932.14 $652.00 $652.00 $696.00 $696.00 $743.85 $743.85
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2395 6131 Lyndex #510-031C.T. | As Specd | As Specd
8pc. R8 end mill adapter set. Rutland Tools P/N

56 |5000 2301 or equal 1 $621.95 $621.95 $488.92 $488.92 $550.00 $550.00 $475.80 $475.80
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #5000 2301 Lyndex #830-008 As Specd | As Specd
r8 keyless albrecht drill chuck. Rutland Tools P/N

57 [2425 8442 or equal 1 $419.05 $419.05 $358.92 $358.92 $363.00 $363.00 $334.40 $334.40
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2425 8442 | Albrecht #130-R8 As Specd [ As Specd
jacobs chuck arbor. Rutland Tools P/N 2531

58 16024 or equal 1 $22.13 $22.13 $13.15 $13.15 $18.00 $18.00 $17.70 $17.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2531 6024 Jacobs #7307 As Specd | As Specd
jacobs chuck. Rutland Tools P/N 2425 7035 or

59 [equal 1 $175.64 $175.64 $112.69 $112.69 $152.00 $152.00 $141.85 $141.85
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2425 7035 Jacobs #3A As Specd [ As Specd
jacobs chuck arbor. Rutland Tools P/N 2531

60 |6064 or equal 1 $97.51 $97.51 $58.62 $58.62 $79.00 $79.00 $79.05 $79.05
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2531 6064 Jacobs #7327 As Specd | As Specd
jacobs chuck. Rutland Tools P/N 2425 7110 or

61 [equal 1 $160.00 $160.00 $102.97 $102.97 $138.00 $138.00 $129.25 $129.25
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2425 7110 Jacobs #11N As Specd [ As Specd
jacobs chuck for cnc. Rutland Tools P/N 2425

62 |7522 or equal 1 $404.09 $404.09 $242.58 $242.58 $347.00 $347.00 $326.30 $326.30
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2425 7522 Jacobs JK130-MT4 As Specd | As Specd
jacobs live center 5mt. Rutland Tools P/N 2575

63 [8025 or equal 1 $395.95 $395.95 $250.89 $250.89 $360.00 $360.00 $319.75 $319.75
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2575 8025 Jacobs JLR-M500 As Specd [ As Specd
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jacobs live center 4mt. Rutland Tools P/N 2575

64 8024 or equal 1 $267.40 $267.40 $170.15 $170.15 $244.00 $244.00 $215.95 $215.95
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2575 8024 Jacobs JLR-M400 As Specd | As Specd
5mt to 4mt for live center. Rutland Tools P/N

65 [2542 7118 or equal 1 $50.45 $50.45 $33.97 $33.97 $42.00 $42.00 $40.75 $40.75
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2542 7118 Jacobs #30428 As Specd [ As Specd
jacobs live center 2mt. Rutland Tools P/N 2575

66 |8022 or equal 1 $180.10 $180.10 $127.65 $127.65 $182.00 $182.00 $145.50 $145.50
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2575 8022 Jacobs JLR-M200 As Specd | As Specd
2.5" precision boring head. Rutland Tools P/N

67 [2571 3075 or equal 1 $387.35 $387.35 $211.25 $211.25 $232.00 $232.00 $286.00 $286.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2571 3075 Apt BHR8BS As Specd [ As Specd
t slot cam lock. Rutland Tools P/N 2350 0152 or

68 |equal 4 $120.59 $482.36 $105.37 $421.48 $113.00 $452.00 $97.40 $389.60
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2350 0152 | Mitee-Bite #10644 As Specd | As Specd
drill press vise. Rutland Tools P/N 2292 9430 or

69 [equal 1 $92.54 $92.54 $0.00 $84.00 $84.00 $74.75 $74.75
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2292 9430 No Bid No Bid Import Quality #4PSV
precision mini tilt vise. Rutland Tools P/N 2292

70 19418 or equal 2 $297.21 $594.42 $0.00 $257.00 $514.00 $237.20 $474.40
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2292 9418 No Bid No Bid As Specd | As Specd
precision grinding vise. Rutland Tools P/N 2292

71 [9390 or equal 1 $694.00 $694.00 $0.00 $586.00 $586.00 $540.45 $540.45
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2292 9390 No Bid No Bid As Specd [ As Specd
polygon machine vise. Rutland Tools P/N 2292

72 19372 or equal 1 $983.78 $983.78 $0.00 $821.00 $821.00 $757.05 $757.05
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2292 9372 No Bid No Bid As Specd | As Specd
quick change tool holder. Rutland Tools P/N

73 [7050 or equal 1 $6.25 $6.25 $752.60 $752.60 $823.00 $823.00 $758.60 $758.60
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools #7050 Aloris 1-AS AXA-11100 As Specd [ As Specd
quick change tool holder. Rutland Tools P/N

74 7350 or equal 1 $295.00 $295.00 $1,322.00 $1,322.00 $1,449.00 | $1,449.00 [ $1,335.70 | $1,335.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools #7350 Aloris 4-AS CA-41100 As Specd | As Specd
5c solid collet stop. Rutland Tools P/N 2399

75 [5319 or equal 3 $10.40 $31.20 $0.00 $7.50 $22.50 $6.70 $20.10
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2399 5319 No Bid Import Quality | #MCS0385
royal live center 2mt. Rutland Tools P/N 2575

76 10120 or equal 1 $315.00 $315.00 $249.30 $249.30 $271.00 $271.00 $254.15 $254.15
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2575 0120 Royal #10532 As Specd | As Specd
royal live center 4mt. Rutland Tools P/N 2575

77 (0124 or equal 1 $430.58 $430.58 $339.75 $339.75 $371.00 $371.00 $347.70 $347.70
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2575 0124 Royal #10534 As Specd [ As Specd
universal dividing head. Rutland Tools P/N 5000

78 2112 or equal 1 $940.33 $940.33 $698.00 $698.00 $1,084.00 | $1,084.00 [ $655.45 $655.45

Vertex

Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #5000 2122 | W/Bison BS0+8100500 Vertex BS-2
carbide tip tool bits 3/8". Rutland Tools P/N 2035

79 |1066 or equal 10 $3.48 $34.80 $2.64 $26.40 $2.95 $29.50 $1.70 $17.00
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2035 1066 | Federal Tool AR6-c6 Import Quality | #383-0036
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plug gage pin set with certification. Rutland Tools
80 |P/N 9000 1611 or equal 1| $1,225.24 $1,225.24 $0.00 $2,757.00 | $2,757.00 | $854.35 $854.35
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #9000 1611 No Bid No Bid As Specd | As Specd
18"x24"granite table stand. Rutland Tools P/N
81 [2170 8200 or equal 1 $368.26 $368.26 $0.00 $465.00 $465.00 $297.40 $297.40
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2170 8200 No Bid No Bid As Specd [ As Specd
90 degree drill press vise. Rutland Tools P/N
82 |2297 5701 or equal 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $23.15 $23.15
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2292 5701 No Bid No Bid No Quote No Quote
bull head live center. Rutland Tools P/N 2575
83 [2304 or equal 1 $229.41 $229.41 $137.60 $137.60 $201.00 $201.00 $165.75 $165.75
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2575 2304 MEDA #1940045 As Specd [ As Specd
carbide tip tool bits 1/2". Rutland Tools P/N 2036
84 6801 or equal 10 $3.82 $38.20 $3.10 $31.00 $3.55 $35.50 $1.85 $18.50
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2036 6801 | Federal Tool AL8-c6 Import Quality | #383-0156
wavy parallel set. Rutland Tools P/N 2158 3000
85 [or equal 1 $62.12 $62.12 $44.80 $44.80 $62.00 $62.00 $45.95 $45.95
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2158 3000 MEDA  [#2410000-7003w4 Import Quality |  #637-7400
xtra range microscope. Rutland Tools P/N 2166
86 |1290 or equal 1 $393.57 $393.57 $285.75 $285.75 $319.00 $319.00 $301.10 $301.10
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2166 1290 Fowler #53-640-280 As Specd | As Specd
screw jack set. Rutland Tools P/N 2330 0038 or
87 [equal 4 $32.59 $130.36 $22.45 $89.80 $24.75 $99.00 $24.93 $99.72
Manufacturer/Part No. Rutland Tools | #2330 0038 Fowler #52-104-000 As Specd [ As Specd
GRAND TOTAL $131,052.30 $55,160.16 $111,253.82 $104,117.55




